

BALTIMORE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Joe A. Hairston, Superintendent

6901 Charles Street Towson, Maryland 21204-3711

May 23, 2008

To whom it may concern:

This letter is to inform you that the Baltimore County Public Schools (BCPS) Office of Purchasing has made recommendation of award for the solicitation JMI-626-08 Information Technology Contracted Staffing Services.

The following firms have been selected and are pending approval by the Board of Education of Baltimore County at their regularly scheduled board meeting on July 8, 2008.

22nd Century Technologies, Inc.	Washington, DC
A.E. Brodhurst Corporation	Glen Burnie, MD
Artisys Corporation	Washington, DC
CTI Global Solutions	Largo, MD
DEVNIX Inc.	Baltimore, MD
E-Consulting Inc.	Irving TX
Elucid Solutions Inc.	Bethesda, MD
Engineering Technology Associates Inc.	Troy, MI
Irvine Technology	Santa Ana, CA
Ismart LLC	Elkridge, MD
MGT of America Inc.	Tallahassee, FL
Moten Tate Inc.	Orlando, FL
RAD Gov	Fort Lauderdale, FL
Sigman & Summerfield Associates, Inc.	Towson, MD
Software People Inc.	Smithtown, NY
SONA Networks	Hunt Valley, MD
System Inc. of Delaware	Atlanta, GA
Tidal Technologies Corporation	Glen Burnie, MD
Yoh Services LLC	Philadelphia, PA

Thank you for your interest in partnering with BCPS. We support and encourage your participation in future BCPS projects. If you have any questions concerning this notification, please contact me at 1940 Greenspring Drive, Suite G, Timonium, MD 21093, email: jmiller14@bcps.org, phone: 410-887-4334, fax: 410-887-7831.

Sincerely,

Jeff Miller

Jeffery J. Miller, C.P.M., Purchasing Agent

c: Bid file

The Board minutes of July 8, 2008 state that the contracts were approved.

Information Technology Contracted Staffing Services for Baltimore
Solicitation Number: JMI-626-08

Item/Description	22nd Century Technologies Inc.	A.E. Brodhurst Corporation	Artisys Corporation
Item 1/Base Hourly Rate for Project Manager	\$ 110.00	\$ 53.00	No Bid
Item 2/Base Hourly Rate for Architecture Engineer	No Bid	\$ 53.00	No Bid
Item 3/Base Hourly rate for Applications Developer	\$ 95.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 85.00
Item 4/Base Hourly Rate for SQL Server DBA	\$ 95.00	\$ 43.00	\$ 89.00
Item 5/Base Hourly Rate for Business Systems Analyst	\$ 90.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 70.00
Item 6/Base Hourly Rate for Cognos/Visual Basic Developer	\$ 90.00	\$ 29.00	\$ 65.00
Item 7/Base Hourly Rate for MS Exchange/SQL Engineer	No Bid	\$ 55.00	\$ 92.00

NO BIDS:

CablingConcepts, 485 Adams Ln., Severna Park,
MD 21146

Swift Staffing, 2 West Rolling Crossroads, Suite
112 Catonsville , MD 21228

IMPORTANT: NO AWARD HAS BEEN MADE.

Award bidder (s) has not yet been identified. Complete evaluation of the bids by BCPS representatives will be completed by the Office of Purchasing after the completed evaluation. Bids will not be available for review by bidders at the present a recommendation to the Board of Education prior to bids being available for review. Bid documents are available at the Office of Purchasing Board. Bidders may call the Office of Purchasing to set up a date and time for reviewing bid documents.

for Baltimore County Public Schools,
VI-626-08

CTI Global Solutions	DEVNIX Inc.	E-Consulting Inc.	Elucid Solutions Inc.	Engineering Technology Associates Inc.
\$ 70.00	\$ 80.18	\$ 100.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 92.00
\$ 109.00	\$ 109.22	\$ 85.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 81.00
\$ 94.00	\$ 67.19	\$ 80.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 72.00
\$ 74.00	\$ 57.34	\$ 85.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 67.00
\$ 50.00	\$ 54.61	\$ 90.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 65.00
\$ 72.00	\$ 88.78	\$ 79.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 70.00
\$ 61.00	\$ 55.77	\$ 89.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 68.00

representatives will occur in the near future. The recommended award will be available in any bidders at the bid opening. BCPS reserves the right to review all materials and bid documents will only be available for review after approval of the contract by the documents.

Irvine Technology	Ismart LLC	MGT of America Inc.	Moten Tate Inc.	RAD Gov	Sigman & Summerfield Associates Inc.
\$ 65.25	\$ 90.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 61.63	\$ 85.00	\$ 90.00
\$ 90.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 92.44	\$ 132.00	\$ 84.00
\$ 72.50	\$ 75.00	\$ 145.00	\$ 61.63	\$ 73.00	\$ 76.00
\$ 72.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 55.46	\$ 80.00	\$ 88.00
\$ 72.50	No Bid	\$ 115.00	\$ 55.46	\$ 80.00	\$ 61.00
\$ 72.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 67.79	\$ 86.00	\$ 65.00
\$ 79.25	\$ 65.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 49.30	No Bid	\$ 86.00

Software People Inc.	SONA Networks	System Inc. of Delaware	Tidal Technologies Corporation	Yoh Services LLC
\$ 90.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 91.00	\$ 64.00
\$ 115.00	\$ 71.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 69.50	\$ 62.00
\$ 80.00	\$ 63.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 58.00
\$ 80.00	\$ 63.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 60.00
\$ 80.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 56.00	\$ 56.00
\$ 90.00	\$ 69.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 59.50	\$ 48.00
\$ 85.00	\$ 69.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 48.00