
Bid Number:  MBU-508-17

Bid Name:  Purchase of Floor Care Machines and Associated Equipment
 

Equipment Group MANUFACTURER

List 

Pric

e

Bid %
Acme Paper 

& Supply

Al's Floorcare, 

Inc. dba Aerus 

LLC Electrolux

City Group, 

Inc.

FPC 

Distribution 

(Holdings)

Leonard Paper 

Company

National 

Supply Co.

Office 

Depot

Quaker City 

Paper Co.

S. Freedman 

& Sons

Superior 

Supply Ltd.
Veritiv

Viking 

Chemicals, Inc.

BATTERY OPERATED BURNISHERS  

4.1 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Eagle Power Products % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

4.2 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.3 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.4 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

4.5 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid 22% 28% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.6 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.7 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32% No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

4.8 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Taski Floor Care Machines % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

4.9 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Cleaning Equipment Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

4.11 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.12 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Viper Industrial Products % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.13 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Windsor Industries, Inc % off list 27% No Bid No Bid No Bid 25% No Bid No Bid 23% 20% 10% No Bid No Bid

4.14 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) ALTERNATE(S)

Pioneer Eclipse 300 BU 20TCL % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pioneer Eclipse-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20%

Clarke-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

ELECTRIC BURNISHERS   No Bid

4.1 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Eagle Power Products % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

4.2 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.3 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.4 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

4.5 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid 25% 32% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.6 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list 45% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.20% No Bid 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.7 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 36% No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

4.8 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Taski Floor Care Machines % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

4.9 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Cleaning Equipment Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

4.11 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.12 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Viper Industrial Products % off list 55% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.13 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Windsor Industries, Inc % off list 32% No Bid No Bid No Bid 35% No Bid No Bid 28% 20% 10% No Bid No Bid

4.14 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) ALTERNATE(S)

Pacific % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Edic % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hawk USA % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pioneer Eclipse 225BU20 % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hawk Enterprises % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

Edic-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30%

Clarke-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

PROPANE OPERATED BURNISHERS   No Bid No Bid

4.1 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Eagle Power Products % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

4.2 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.3 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.4 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

4.5 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.6 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list 40% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.21% No Bid 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.7 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

4.8 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Taski Floor Care Machines % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

4.9 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10  Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Cleaning Equipment Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

4.11 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 22% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.12 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Viper Industrial Products % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.13 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) Windsor Industries, Inc % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 22% 20% 10% No Bid No Bid

4.14 Group #1 Burnishers (high speed) ALTERNATE(S) No Bid

AZTEC % off list 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pioneer Eclipse PE420BU21BSX % off list No Bid No Bid 18% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Betco Optima QT-All Sizes % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

AZTEC % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 33% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hawk USA % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pioneer Eclipse 225BU20 % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pioneer Eclipse-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15%

Clarke-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid
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Equipment Group MANUFACTURER

List 

Pric

e

Bid %
Acme Paper 

& Supply

Al's Floorcare, 

Inc. dba Aerus 

LLC Electrolux

City Group, 

Inc.

FPC 

Distribution 

(Holdings)

Leonard Paper 

Company

National 

Supply Co.

Office 

Depot

Quaker City 

Paper Co.

S. Freedman 

& Sons

Superior 

Supply Ltd.
Veritiv

Viking 

Chemicals, Inc.

BATTERY OPERATED SCRUBBERS  

5.1 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Eagle Power Products % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

5.2 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.3 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.4 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

5.5 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.6 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.21% No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.7 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32% No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

5.8 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Taski Floor Care Machines % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

5.9 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.10 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Cleaning Equipment Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

5.11 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.12 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Viper Industrial Products % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.13 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Windsor Industries, Inc % off list 32% No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid 22% 30% 10% No Bid No Bid

5.14 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) ALTERNATE(S) No Bid No Bid

Pacific S20 or S28 Orbital Scrubber % off list No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pacific % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hawk, Square Scrub, Doodle Scrub % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pacific Floor Care S-28 & S-30 % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Clarke-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

ELECTRIC SCRUBBERS  
5.1 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Eagle Power Products % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 31% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

5.2 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.3 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.4 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

5.5 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid 22% 32% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.6 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list 45% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.99% No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.7 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 36% No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

5.8 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Taski Floor Care Machines % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

5.9 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.10 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Cleaning Equipment Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

5.11 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 31% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.12 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Viper Industrial Products % off list 55% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.13 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Windsor Industries, Inc % off list 32% No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid 26% 20% 10% No Bid No Bid

5.14 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) ALTERNATE(S) No Bid

Edic % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

All Models Hawk USA, Square Scrub, Doodle Scrub % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hawk Enterprises % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

Edic 20LS3-BK_SV % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30%

Clarke-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

PROPANE OPERATED SCRUBBERS  
5.1 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Eagle Power Products % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.2 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.3 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.4 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

5.5 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.6 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.7 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

5.8 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Taski Floor Care Machines % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

5.9 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.10 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Cleaning Equipment Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

5.11 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.12 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Viper Industrial Products % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.13 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) Windsor Industries, Inc % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid

5.14 Group #2 Scrubbers (low speed) ALTERNATE(S)

AZTEC % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 33% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hawk USA % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pioneer Eclipse-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15%

Clarke-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

CARPET EXTRACTORS

6.1 Group #3 Carpet Extractors Eagle Power Products % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

6.2 Group #3 Carpet Extractors Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6.3 Group #3 Carpet Extractors Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6.4 Group #3 Carpet Extractors Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

6.5 Group #3 Carpet Extractors NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid 22% 28% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6.6 Group #3 Carpet Extractors Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list 40% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.39% No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid

6.7 Group #3 Carpet Extractors Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32% No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

6.8 Group #3 Carpet Extractors Taski Floor Care Machines % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

6.9 Group #3 Carpet Extractors Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6.10 Group #3 Carpet Extractors Cleaning Equipment Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

6.11 Group #3 Carpet Extractors Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6.12 Group #3 Carpet Extractors Viper Industrial Products % off list 55% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

6.13 Group #3 Carpet Extractors Windsor Industries, Inc % off list 27% No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid 23% 20% 10% No Bid No Bid

6.14 Group #3 Carpet Extractors ALTERNATE(S)  

Edic Super Nova % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid 25% No Bid No Bid

Edic-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30%

Clarke Carpet Extractors % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

VACUUMS

7.1 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) Eagle Power Products % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 31% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

7.2 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Equipment Group MANUFACTURER

List 

Pric

e

Bid %
Acme Paper 

& Supply

Al's Floorcare, 

Inc. dba Aerus 

LLC Electrolux

City Group, 

Inc.

FPC 

Distribution 

(Holdings)

Leonard Paper 

Company

National 

Supply Co.

Office 

Depot

Quaker City 

Paper Co.

S. Freedman 

& Sons

Superior 

Supply Ltd.
Veritiv

Viking 

Chemicals, Inc.

7.3 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7.4 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 31% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

7.5 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid 25% 32% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7.6 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list 40% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.01% No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid

7.7 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35% No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

7.8 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) Taski Floor Care Machines % off list 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

7.9 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7.10 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) Cleaning Equipment Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

7.11 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 31% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7.12 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) Viper Industrial Products % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

7.13 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) Windsor Industries, Inc % off list 27% No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid 26% 20% 10% No Bid No Bid

7.14 Group #4 Vacuums (all types) ALTERNATE(S)  

Commercial Upright by Aerus LLC Model # 00644 % off list No Bid 38% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pro-chem % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hoover Hushtone 13 Plus % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pro Team % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25%

Clarke / Hoover / Pro Team % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

AUTOMATIC SCRUBBING MACHINES-WALK BEHIND

8.1 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind Eagle Power Products % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

8.2 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.3 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.4 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

8.5 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid 20% 28% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.6 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.99% No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.7 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32% No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

8.8 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind Taski Floor Care Machines % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

8.9 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.10
Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind Cleaning 

Equipment
Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

8.11 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.12 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind Viper Industrial Products % off list 55% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.13 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind Windsor Industries, Inc % off list 27% No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid 23% 20% 10% No Bid No Bid

8.14 Group #5 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Walk Behind ALTERNATE(S)  No Bid

Pacific % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 33% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pacific Floorcare S-28 & S-20 % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Clarke-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

AUTOMATIC SCRUBBING MACHINES-RIDE ON

9.1 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES Eagle Power Products % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

9.2 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.3 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.4 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

9.5 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid 20% 24% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.6 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.7 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32% No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

9.8 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES Taski Floor Care Machines % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

9.9 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.10
Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On Cleaning 

Equipment-ALL SIZES
Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

9.11 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.12 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES Viper Industrial Products % off list 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.13 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES Windsor Industries, Inc % off list 27% No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid 23% 20% 10% No Bid No Bid

9.14 Group #6 Automatic Scrubbing Machines Ride On-ALL SIZES ALTERNATE(S)

Clarke-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

PICK UP MACHINES-WALK BEHIND

10.1 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind Eagle Power Products % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 24% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

10.2 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.3 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.4 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 24% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

10.5 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid 22% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.6 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list 40% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.40% No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.7 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.8 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind Taski Floor Care Machines % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

10.9 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.10 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind Cleaning Equipment Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

10.11 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 24% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.12 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind Viper Industrial Products % off list 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.13 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind Windsor Industries, Inc % off list 27% No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid 23% 20% 10% No Bid No Bid

10.14 Group #7 Pick Up Machines - Walk Behind ALTERNATE(S)

NACE Care WVD1800DH % off list No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Edic % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Clarke-All Models % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid
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Equipment Group MANUFACTURER

List 

Pric

e

Bid %
Acme Paper 

& Supply

Al's Floorcare, 

Inc. dba Aerus 

LLC Electrolux

City Group, 

Inc.

FPC 

Distribution 

(Holdings)

Leonard Paper 

Company

National 

Supply Co.

Office 

Depot

Quaker City 

Paper Co.

S. Freedman 

& Sons

Superior 

Supply Ltd.
Veritiv

Viking 

Chemicals, Inc.

OTHER MISCELLANEOUS EQUIPMENT

11.1 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment Eagle Power Products % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

11.2 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11.3 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11.4 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

11.5 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11.6 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid

11.7 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32% No Bid No Bid 21% No Bid

11.8 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment Taski Floor Care Machines % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

11.9 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11.10 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment Cleaning Equipment Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

11.11 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11.12 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment Viper Industrial Products % off list 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

11.13 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment Windsor Industries, Inc % off list 27% No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid

11.14 Group #8 Other Miscellaneous Equipment ALTERNATE(S)

Pacific % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Edic % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

All Models Hawk USA, Square Scrub, Doodle Scrub % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Nacecare JS1600 Steamer % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Square Scrub % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10%

Hawk Enterprises % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35%

Tomcat Zero3 880-2670 Aqueous Ozone Chemical Free Cleaning Technology % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8% No Bid

PARTS AND ACCESSORIES

12.1 Group #9 Parts and Accessories Eagle Power Products % off list 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 5%

12.2 Group #9 Parts and Accessories Kent/Euroclean % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28% No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid

12.3 Group #9 Parts and Accessories Mastercraft Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.4 Group #9 Parts and Accessories Minuteman International % off list No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid No Bid 28% No Bid 10% No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid

12.5 Group #9 Parts and Accessories NSS Enterprises, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid 16% 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.6 Group #9 Parts and Accessories Nilfisk-Advance, Inc. % off list 30% No Bid 22% No Bid No Bid 28% No Bid 20% 28% No Bid 5% No Bid

12.7 Group #9 Parts and Accessories Nobles Industries, Inc. % off list No Bid No Bid 22% No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid

12.8 Group #9 Parts and Accessories Taski Floor Care Machines % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid

12.9 Group #9 Parts and Accessories Tennant Company % off list No Bid No Bid 22% No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid

12.10 Group #9 Parts and Accessories Cleaning Equipment Tomcat Commerical Cleaning Equipment % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid

12.11 Group #9 Parts and Accessories Tornado Industries, Inc. % off list 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28% No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.12 Group #9 Parts and Accessories Viper Industrial Products % off list 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28% No Bid 20% 28% No Bid 5% No Bid

12.13 Group #9 Parts and Accessories Windsor Industries, Inc % off list 27% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% 28% No Bid 20% 28% 10% 5% No Bid

12.14 Group #9 Parts and Accessories ALTERNATE(S)

Aerus LLC Electrolux Combination Assy Kit W/Slinky Hose & Wand Part # 47120 % off list No Bid 35% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pacific % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mosiqusts % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hawk USA, Square Scrub, Doodle Scrub % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Clarke / ProTeam / Hoover / Mi-T-M % off list No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid

IMPORTANT:  NO AWARD HAS BEEN MADE.

Award bidder (s) has not yet been identified.   Complete evaluation of the bids by BCPS representatives will occur in the near future.  The recommended award will be available in 

the Office of Purchasing after the completed evaluation.  BCPS reserves the right to review all materials and present a recommendation to the Board of Education prior to bids 

being available for review. Bids will not be available for review by bidders at the bid opening.  Bid documents will only be available for review after approval of the contract by the 
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